Pre-publication draft for submission to third-party artificial intelligence (Al) for facts-
evidence-analysis (FEA) check for a developing report on MHProNews.

ICYMI: Sen. Tim Scott Highlights the 21st Century ROAD to Housing Act. Evidence from
Sources Including Supporters that 'Housing for the 21st Century Act' WON'T Solve Housing
Crisis. FEA

Instead of cheerleading for a bill that fails to address the core issues that have throttled
manufactured housing production for over 25 years, the Manufactured Housing Institute
(MHI) ought to be demanding amendments to pending legislation in as deliberate a manner
as the National Association of Homebuilders (NAHB) is doing. NAHB is reportedly pulling
support (see X-post below) for the Senate version of the housing legislation due to their
concerns that Build to Rent (BTR) construction by investors is going to be harmed by the
President Donald Trump (R) call to ban certain investors from buying single family houses.
Agree or not with the NAHB’s reported move, isn’t that arguably the kind of backbone
manufactured housing advocacy needs from MHI? Beyond that, intentionally or not,
UnidosUS has exposed via Facebook that the revised Senate language in the legislation will

only increase production/preservation by 400,000 units in a decade. If so, that would be
only 40,000 units a year, only 800 units average per state, at a time when Pew has
estimated a need of 4-7 million units and Gemini has supported estimated needs in the 5-
8+ million units. Restated, MHProNews observes that this is simple math. The Housing
for the 21st Century Act will utterly fail to close the gap for affordable housing. Indeed,
the math reveals the gap could worsen as the U.S. population grows. The facts-evidence-
analysis (FEA) of that finding follows in this preface, Parts | and Il of this MHVille report.

1) The following X-posts provide some of the various perspectives on the developing
legislation.

The Committee's Housing for the 21st Century Act delivers real solutions to bring down
housing costs. By expanding housing supply and cutting costly, burdensome regulations
that drive up construction prices, we’re working to make housing more affordable.
American families deserve... https://t.co/5BelgTEpy4

— Financial Services GOP (@FinancialCmte) March 2, 2026

NAR throws its weight behind the Senate’s housing bill in another letter today shared with
me ¥ pic.twitter.com/qNf2A5IL0g

— Eleanor Mueller (@Eleanor_Mueller) March 5, 2026


https://manufacturedhousingassociationregulatoryreform.org/why-manufactured-housing-production-remains-suppressed-and-what-could-change-it-manufactured-housing-association-for-regulatory-reform-mharr-issues-and-perspect/
https://manufacturedhousingassociationregulatoryreform.org/why-manufactured-housing-production-remains-suppressed-and-what-could-change-it-manufactured-housing-association-for-regulatory-reform-mharr-issues-and-perspect/
https://www.manufacturedhomepronews.com/wp-content/uploads/2026/02/ClaytonChampionCavcoManufacturedHousingInstituteJointRevealWTAS-WhatTheyAreSayingSeePoliticosCorpInterestGroupsPraiseforHousePassedHousingForThe21stCenturyActFEA.jpg
https://manufacturedhousingassociationregulatoryreform.org/?s=amendments
https://www.pew.org/en/research-and-analysis/articles/2025/12/16/housing-shortage-takes-center-stage
https://www.pew.org/en/research-and-analysis/articles/2025/12/16/housing-shortage-takes-center-stage
https://www.manufacturedhomepronews.com/gemini-on-the-8-million-unit-gap-how-a-man-made-decline-in-manufactured-housing-fueled-americas-affordable-housing-crisis-unique-artificial-intelligence-look-at-mhville-performance-f
https://www.manufacturedhomepronews.com/gemini-on-the-8-million-unit-gap-how-a-man-made-decline-in-manufactured-housing-fueled-americas-affordable-housing-crisis-unique-artificial-intelligence-look-at-mhville-performance-f
https://www.manufacturedhomepronews.com/wp-content/uploads/2025/10/Editorial-Disclosures-and-Publication-Insights-by-Manufactured-Home-Pro-News-MHProNews10.12.2025.pdf
https://www.manufacturedhomepronews.com/wp-content/uploads/2025/08/MHVilleFEA-DefinedFacts-Evidence-AnalysisDianaDutsykHighestFormOfJournalismIsAnalyticalJournalismGriffinsNestHowardWalkerTonyKovachsPublicationsAmericanPressInstituteAPI-MHProNews.jpg
https://www.manufacturedhomepronews.com/wp-content/uploads/2025/08/MHVilleFEA-DefinedFacts-Evidence-AnalysisDianaDutsykHighestFormOfJournalismIsAnalyticalJournalismGriffinsNestHowardWalkerTonyKovachsPublicationsAmericanPressInstituteAPI-MHProNews.jpg
https://t.co/5BeIqTEpy4
https://twitter.com/FinancialCmte/status/2028497385538662620?ref_src=twsrc%5Etfw
https://t.co/qNf2A5IL0g
https://twitter.com/Eleanor_Mueller/status/2029701902657564989?ref_src=twsrc%5Etfw

News: The National Association of Home Builders told congressional offices it would
*oppose* the Senate's 21st Century ROAD to Housing Act, pointing to the bill’s institutional
investor limits.

This is a significant turnabout for the NAHB. Here’s the email we obtained:
pic.twitter.com/Qxz6uKEKEq

— Brendan Pedersen (@BrendanPedersen) March 4, 2026

Rather than prioritize election integrity, all but one House Democrat voted to advance the
Housing Bill to the Senate. It grows HUD, lacks a CBO score, and offers no safeguards to
block illegal aliens from funds. pic.twitter.com/RZ0O3sKdovy

— Brandon Straka #WalkAway (@BrandonStraka) February 27, 2026

The US House passes package on housing affordability guidelines to increase housing
supply

Final Vote
@ VYes: 390
® No:9

No Votes:

@ Massie (KY)

@ Biggs (A2)

@ Brecheen (0OK)
® Crane (AZ)

® Gosar (A2)

@ McClintock (CA)
® Roy (TX)

® Zinke (MT)

@ Fletcher (TX)

— OSZ (@OpenSourceZone) February 10, 2026

That’s not a typo. NINETY votes to consider @SenatorTimScott’s bipartisan 21st Century
ROAD to Housing Act. If passed, it would help put the American Dream more within reach
for families. https://t.co/4gSoVnsNrS



https://t.co/Qxz6uKEkEq
https://twitter.com/BrendanPedersen/status/2029248385912340510?ref_src=twsrc%5Etfw
https://t.co/RZO3sKdovy
https://twitter.com/BrandonStraka/status/2027180825746534743?ref_src=twsrc%5Etfw
https://twitter.com/OpenSourceZone/status/2021047276831916124?ref_src=twsrc%5Etfw
https://twitter.com/SenatorTimScott?ref_src=twsrc%5Etfw
https://t.co/4qSoVnsNrS

— Ryan Wrasse (@RWrasse) March 4, 2026

There are so many bad ideas in the Senate’s Road to Housing package it's hard to believe
the GOP has majorities... let alone the House, Senate, and White House.

Meanwhile, the House passed 21st Century Housing with no partisan poison pills and 390
votes.

Apparently Elizabeth...

— Warren Davidson us (@WarrenDavidson) March 5, 2026

The HFSC ranking member isn’t strictly happy with the Senate’s 21st Century ROAD to
Housing Act. But Rep. Maxine Waters says regardless of what happens next in the process,
a housing bill is a housing bill.@BrendanPedersen has the details:https://t.co/JoGY81nPif

— Punchbowl News (@PunchbowlNews) March 5, 2026

2) Via Facebook, UnidosUS provided apparent support for the bill. But in doing so, when
carefully considered, the figures they provided undermine the claims of supporters of the
Housing for the 21st Century Act, as was noted above. When millions of units are needed, a
mere estimated 400k more units 'built or preserved' reveals the crisis will get worse if this
legislation is being depended upon in its current form.

Third Party Content Provided Under Fair Use Guidelines.

3 ; . )
) Facebook- Unidosuss days ago Housing for the 21st Century Act MI-TPRO[:]EIE,COM

If passed, this bill could create or preserve some 1.3 million affordable homes over 10 years, about 400,000 units over the current projections

3) Because the Senate's own 2-page brief claims the following.

...The 21st Century ROAD to Housing Act preempts local zoning decisions.


https://twitter.com/RWrasse/status/2029255661247234057?ref_src=twsrc%5Etfw
https://twitter.com/WarrenDavidson/status/2029544148332597698?ref_src=twsrc%5Etfw
https://twitter.com/BrendanPedersen?ref_src=twsrc%5Etfw
https://t.co/JoGY81nPif
https://twitter.com/PunchbowlNews/status/2029703142082752910?ref_src=twsrc%5Etfw
https://www.banking.senate.gov/imo/media/doc/road_myth_vs_fact.pdf
https://www.manufacturedhomepronews.com/wp-content/uploads/2026/03/Senate2PageBriefroad_myth_vs_fact21stCenturyROADtoHousingActMHProNews.pdf

FACT: By design, the 21st Century ROAD to Housing Act does not preempt local or state
zoning.

This is one reason why the U.S. Conference of Mayors and the National League of Cities
support the

bill. Chairman Scott believes zoning decisions are best made locally, not in Washington.

Yet, as Pew research revealed, multiple states have recognized that it is precisely local
zoning barriers that are near the heart of the housing crisis underproduction

problem. Several states recognize the need for more inherently affordable manufactured
housing. So, by failing to deal with the barrier of local zoning, by failing to invoke and
strengthen federal enhanced preemption, an array of facts and evidence demonstrate that

this bill will not work as claimed by its supporters.

4) That said, to provide balance and detail from original source materials, from Senator Tim
Scott's (SC-R) press release in Part I: “So, what you’ll find in this legislation is we startin
local jurisdictions, and we start by making sure that both the House, the Senate,
Republicans and Democrats, do not see this issue as red versus blue, House versus
Senate." The rhetoric sounds impressive: “Promises made, promises kept." The term
"preempt" is found only 6 times in the legislative language, according to MS WORD’s search
tool. there are 33 places where the term “manufactured housing” is used in Senate
document called the "21st Century ROAD to Housing Act." There are 36 places where the
term “manufactured home” appears in that document. The common industry phrase “HUD
Code” is curiously not found. “Modular” yields 15 results. The phrase "off-site" yielded 5
results, but "factory built" turned up no results in the search of the sizable document
produced by the U.S. Senate and for that body along with the broader public.

The bill could be voted on this week in the Senate.

Senate next week is scheduled to vote on bipartisan affordable housing legislation, known
as the 21st Century ROAD to Housing Act, which the White House "strongly supports.”
https://t.co/EApaqlKrjr https://t.co/USDd1pzAQ0E

— Craig Caplan (@CraigCaplan) March 7, 2026

That said, President Donald J. Trump (R) has tossed in a new wrinkle.


https://www.pew.org/en/research-and-analysis/articles/2025/09/03/states-take-crucial-steps-to-expand-supply-of-lower-cost-single-family-homes
https://manufacturedhousingassociationregulatoryreform.org/?s=inherently%20affordable%20manufactured%20homes
https://manufacturedhousingassociationregulatoryreform.org/?s=inherently%20affordable%20manufactured%20homes
https://www.manufacturedhomepronews.com/wp-content/uploads/2024/12/HUD-Letter-RichlandMS-RichlandMississipi-EnhancedPreemption-ManufacturedHousingInstitute-MHProNewsPlusPriorScreenCaptures12.6.2024MHProNews-min.png
https://www.banking.senate.gov/imo/media/doc/MIR26311.pdf
https://www.banking.senate.gov/imo/media/doc/MIR26311.pdf
https://www.banking.senate.gov/imo/media/doc/MIR26311.pdf
https://www.manufacturedhomepronews.com/wp-content/uploads/2026/03/MIR26311-Senate21stCenturyROADtoHousingAct.pdf
https://www.manufacturedhomepronews.com/wp-content/uploads/2026/03/MIR26311-Senate21stCenturyROADtoHousingAct.pdf
https://www.manufacturedhomepronews.com/wp-content/uploads/2026/03/MIR26311-Senate21stCenturyROADtoHousingAct.pdf
https://t.co/EApaqIKrjr
https://t.co/USDd1pzA0E
https://twitter.com/CraigCaplan/status/2030328908864762199?ref_src=twsrc%5Etfw

JUST IN - Trump vows not to not sign any other legislation until Congress approves The Save
America Act. pic.twitter.com/HQUS55exvDe

— Disclose.tv (@disclosetv) March 8, 2026

5) This MHVille facts-evidence-analysis (FEA) is underway.

“Analytical journalism is the highest

style of journalism.” - Diana Dutsyk

...the personal courage of the journalist is important,
FACTS-EVIDENCE- he should not be afraid to go against the bosses,
ANALYSIS should not call white black. He [the analytical

journalist] cannot distort the truth.

FACTS EVIDENCE ANALYSIS

2z
B MHPROLTETE.
Copilot sy e, 000 e s s

ICYMI: Sen. Tim Scott highlights the 21st Century ROAD to Housing Act

Part |

Click here or on the image above to watch the full remarks.

WASHINGTON — U.S. Senator Tim Scott (R-SC), Chairman of the Senate Committee on
Banking, Housing, and Urban Affairs, joined Senate Republican Leadership at a press
conference to highlight the 21 Century ROAD to Housing Act, historic legislation to make
the American Dream of becoming a homeowner a reality for hardworking Americans.

Sen. Scott’s remarks below (as delivered):


https://t.co/HQU55exvDe
https://twitter.com/disclosetv/status/2030626654364594639?ref_src=twsrc%5Etfw
https://www.manufacturedhomepronews.com/wp-content/uploads/2025/08/MHVilleFEA-DefinedFacts-Evidence-AnalysisDianaDutsykHighestFormOfJournalismIsAnalyticalJournalismGriffinsNestHowardWalkerTonyKovachsPublicationsAmericanPressInstituteAPI-MHProNews.jpg
https://outreach.senate.gov/iqextranet/iqClickTrk.aspx?&cid=quorum_scott-iq&crop=15944QQQ37245719QQQ8224284QQQ8939794&report_id=&redirect=https%3a%2f%2fyoutu.be%2fi1zEeyL8uZI%3fsi%3d5Ho2dzsPXNcFj4J9&redir_log=429296998163316

On the 21st Century ROAD to Housing Act framework:
“Promises made, promises kept.

“President Trump made a very important promise on the campaign trail, and we are
delivering both the House and the Senate passing historic housing legislation.

“The 21st Century ROAD to Housing Act really does meet the need. It focuses on local
jurisdictions, number one.

“It removes red tape and unnecessary burdensome processes from the federal
government, number two.

“And number three, it creates and will expand housing supply while focusing on
affordability.

“It’s so important as a kid who grew up in poverty, my mother became a first-time home
buyer at the age of 38. Today in America, that age is 40.”

On the solutions:

“How do we bring those prices down? How do we make it easier for your average person to
experience their version of the American Dream through home ownership?

“I think it starts by making sure that Washington understands solutions start at home.

“So, what you’ll find in this legislation is we start in local jurisdictions, and we start by
making sure that both the House, the Senate, Republicans and Democrats, do not see this
issue as red versus blue, House versus Senate.

“We see this as taking care of Americans who desperately want to experience the American
Dream.”

On moving forward:

“We made that possible through legislation that passed the House 399 to 1, passed through
the Senate unanimously.

“Now we find ourselves taking 20 to 21 provisions out of the House bill out of 25 and 36 out
of our 40 creating in harmony legislation that moves housing forward for the average
American, and it’s really good news.”

HH#
Part Il

TITLE Il—MANUFACTURED HOUSING FOR AMERICA



SEC. 301. HOUSING SUPPLY EXPANSION ACT.
(a) IN GENERAL.—Section 603(6) of the National
Manufactured Housing Construction and Safety Stand-

ards Act of 1974 (42 U.S.C. 5402(6)) is amended by striking “on a permanent chassis” and
inserting “with or without a permanent chassis”.

4 (b) STANDARDS FOR MANUFACTURED HOMES BUILT 5 WITHOUT A PERMANENT
CHASSIS.—Section 604(a) of 6 the National Manufactured Housing Construction and

7 Safety Standards Act of 1974 (42 U.S.C. 5403(a)) is 8 amended by adding the following:
9 “(7) STANDARDS FOR MANUFACTURED HOMES

10 BUILT WITHOUT A PERMANENT CHASSIS.— 11 “(A) IN GENERAL.—The Secretary, in
con12 sultation with the consensus committee, shall

e issue revised standards for manufactured homes

¢ built without a permanent chassis using the 15 process described in paragraph (4).
16 “(B) CREATING FINAL STANDARDS.—The

o Secretary shall, after consulting and conferring

e with the consensus committee, establish stand-

e ards to ensure that manufactured homes with20 out a permanent chassis have—
21 “(i) a distinct label, with revenue gen-
erated to be deposited into the Manufactured Housing Fees Trust Fund estab-

lished under section 620(e)(1), to be issued by the Secretary distinguishing manufactured
home built without a permanent chassis from manufactured homes built on a permanent
chassis;

4 “(ii) a data plate, as described in secb tion 3280.5 of title 24, Code of Federal

Regulations (or any successor regulation),
e distinguishing manufactured homes built

e without a permanent chassis from manu9 factured homes built on a permanent
chas-

e sis;and



e “(iii) a notation on any invoice pro-

e duced by the manufacturer of a manufac13 tured home that is distinguishable from
14 the invoice for a manufactured home con15 structed with a permanent chassis.”.
16 (c) MANUFACTURED HOME CERTIFICATIONS.—Sec-

17 tion 604 of the National Manufactured Housing Construc18 tion and Safety Standards
Actof 1974 (42 U.S.C. 5403) 19 is amended by adding at the end the following:

20 “(i) MANUFACTURED HOME CERTIFICATIONS.—
21 “(1) IN GENERAL.—

“(A) INITIAL CERTIFICATION.—Subject to subparagraph (B), not later than 1 year after the
date of enactment of the 21st Century

ROAD to Housing Act, a State shall submit to
the Secretary an initial certification that the laws and regulations of the State—
“(i) treat any manufactured home in

e parity with a manufactured home (as de-

o fined and regulated by the State); and

e “(ii) subject a manufactured home

e without a permanent chassis to the same

laws and regulations of the State as a 9 manufactured home built on a permanent
10 chassis, including with respect to financ11 ing, title, insurance, manufacture, sale,

e taxes, transportation, installation, and

e other areas as the Secretary determines,

o after consultation with and approval by the

e consensus committee, are necessary to give 16 effect to the purpose of this
section.

17 “(B) STATE PLAN SUBMISSION.—Any
o State plan submitted under subparagraph (C)

e shall contain the required State certification



e under subparagraph (A) and, if contained

¢ therein, no additional or State certification
under subparagraph (A) or paragraph (3).
“(C) EXTENDED DEADLINE.—With respect

to a State with a legislature that meets biennially, the deadline for the submission of the ini-

tial certification required under subparagraph (A) shall be 2 years after the date of
enactment of the 21st Century ROAD to Housing Act.

4 “(D) LATE CERTIFICATION.— 5 “(i) NO WAIVER.—The Secretary may 6 not waive the
prohibition described in

7 paragraph (5)(B) with respect to a certifi8 cation submitted after the deadline under 9
subparagraph (A) or paragraph (3) unless

o the Secretary approves the late certifi-

12 “(ii) RULE OF CONSTRUCTION.—
13 Nothing in this subsection shall be con14 strued to prevent a State from submitting

15 the initial certification required under sub16 paragraph (A) after the required deadline 17
under that subparagraph.

18 “(2) FORM OF STATE CERTIFICATION NOT PRE19 SENTED IN A STATE PLAN.—The initial
certification 20 required under paragraph (1)(A), if not submitted

21 with a State plan under paragraph (1)(B), shall contain, in a form prescribed by the
Secretary, an attestation by an official that the State has taken the steps necessary to
ensure the veracity of the certifi-

cation required under paragraph (1)(A), including, as necessary, by—

“(A) amending the definition of ‘manufac4  tured home’in the laws and regulations of the
e State; and
¢ “(B)directing State agencies to amend the

e definition of ‘manufactured home’ in regula-



9 “(3) ANNUAL RECERTIFICATION.—Not later
e than a date to be determined by the Secretary each
e year, a State shall submit to the Secretary an addi-
o tional certification that—
e “(A) confirms the accuracy of the initial
e certification submitted under subparagraph (A)
e or (B) of paragraph (1); and

o “(B) certifies that any new laws or regula17 tions enacted or adopted by the State
since the

e date of the previous certification do not change
e the veracity of the initial certification submitted 20 under paragraph (1)(A).
21 “(4) LIST.—The Secretary shall publish and

maintain in the Federal Register and on the website of the Department of Housing and
Urban Development a list of States that are up to date with the submission of initial and
subsequent certifications required under this subsection.

“(5) PROHIBITION.—

4 “(A) DEFINITION.—In this paragraph, the 5 term ‘covered manufactured home’ means a 6
home thatis—

e “(i) not considered a manufactured

o home under the laws and regulations of a 9 State because the home is constructed
10 without a permanent chassis;

e “(ii) considered a manufactured home
« under the definition of the term in section
e 603; and

e “(iii) constructed after the date of en15 actment of the 21st Century ROAD to 16
Housing Act.

17 “(B) BUILDING, INSTALLATION, AND



18 SALE.—If a State does not submit a certifi19 cation under paragraph (1)(A) or (3) by the
o date onwhich those certifications are required
e tobe submitted—
e “(i) with respect to a State in which
e the State administers the installation of

¢ manufactured homes, the State shall pro25 hibit the manufacture, installation, or
sale

of a covered manufactured home within the State; and
“(ii) with respect to a State in which

e the Secretary administers the installation

of manufactured homes, the State and the

Secretary shall prohibit the manufacture,

installation, or sale of a covered manufac8 tured home within the State.”.
9 (d) OTHER FEDERAL LAWS REGULATING MANUFAC-
10 TURED HOMES.—

11 (1) IN GENERAL.—The Secretary of Housing 12 and Urban Development may
coordinate with the

13 heads of other Federal agencies to ensure that Fed14 eral agencies treat a
manufactured home (as defined

in Federal laws and regulations other than section

e 603 of the National Manufactured Housing Con17 struction and Safety Standards
Act of 1974 (42

e S.C.5402)) inthe same manner as a manufac-

e tured home (as defined in section 603 of the Na20 tional Manufactured Housing
Construction and

21 Safety Standards Act of 1974 (42 U.S.C. 5402), as amended by this Act).



(2) ENERGY EFFICIENCY STANDARDS.—

(A) MANUFACTURED HOME DEFINED.—In this paragraph, the term “manufactured home”
has the meaning given the term in section 603 of the National Manufactured Housing Con3
struction and Safety Standards Act of 1974 (42 4 U.S.C. 5402), as amended by this Act.

e (B)—No energy efficiency
¢ standards for manufactured homes developed by

e« any Federal agency shall have legal effect un8 less and until adopted by the
Department of 9 Housing and Urban Development pursuant to

10 the consensus standards and regulatory devel11 opment process described in
section 604(a)(2)

12 of the National Manufactured Housing Con13 struction and Safety Standards Act of
1974 (42 14 U.S.C. 5403(a)(2)).

15 (C) MINIMUM STANDARDS.—The Secretary 16 of Housing and Urban Development
shall— 17 (i) not later than 1 year after the date

¢ of enactment of this Act, adopt minimum
e energy efficiency standards for manufac20 tured homes; and

(ii) not less frequently than once every 3 years after adopting the standards under clause (i),
update those standards.

(e) ASSISTANCE TO STATES.—Section 609 of the National Manufactured Housing
Construction and Safety

Standards Act of 1974 (42 U.S.C. 5408) is amended—
e (1)in paragraph (1), by striking “and’ at the
e end;
e (2)in paragraph (2), by striking the period at
e theendandinserting“; and”’; and
e (3)byadding at the end the following:
e “(3) model guidance to support the submission

o ofthe certification required under section 604(i).”.



e (f) PREEMPTION.—Nothing in this section or the 12 amendments made by this
section shall be construed as

¢ limiting the scope of Federal preemption under section

e 604(d) of the National Manufactured Housing Construc15 tion and Safety Standards
Act of 1974 (42 U.S.C.

e 5403(d)).

e 302. MODULAR HOUSING PRODUCTION ACT.

e (a) DEFINITIONS.—In this section:

e (1) MANUFACTURED HOME.—The term “manu-

o factured home’” has the meaning given the term in

e section 603 of the National Manufactured Housing Construction and Safety
Standards Act of 1974 (42 U.S.C. 5402).

(2) MODULAR HOME.—The term “modular

home” means a home that is constructed in a fac-

toryin 1 or more modules, each of which meets applicable State and local building codes
of the area in which the home will be located, and that are trans-

4 ported to the home building site, installed on foun5 dations, and completed.

6 (3) SECRETARY.—The term “Secretary” means 7 the Secretary of Housing and Urban
Development.

8 (b) FHA CONSTRUCTION FINANCING PROGRAMS.—9 (1) IN GENERAL.—The Secretary
shall conduct

10 a review of Federal Housing Administration con11 struction financing programs to
identify barriers to 12 the use of modular home methods.

13 (2) REQUIREMENTS.—In conducting the review 14 under paragraph (1), the Secretary
shall—

e (A)identify and evaluate regulatory and

e programmatic features that restrict participal17 tion in construction financing
programs by



18 modular home developers, including construc19 tion draw schedules; and
20 (B) identify administrative measures au-

thorized under section 525 of the National Housing Act (12 U.S.C. 1735f-3) to facilitate
program utilization by modular home devel-

opers.

(3) REPORT.—Not later than 1 year after the date of enactment of this Act, the Secretary
shall publish a report that describes the results of the re-

4 view conducted under paragraph (1), which shall in5 clude a description of programmatic
and policy

e changes that the Secretary recommends to reduce or

eliminate identified barriers to the use of modular

home methods in Federal Housing Administration
e construction financing programs.

10 (4) RULEMAKING.—

(A) IN GENERAL.—Not later than 120

days after the date on which the Secretary pub-

lishes the report under paragraph (3), the Sec14 retary shall initiate a rulemaking to
examine an

alternative draw schedule for construction fi-

nancing loans provided to modular and manu17 factured home developers, which
shallinclude

18 the ability for interested stakeholders to provide 19 robust public comment.
o (B) DETERMINATION.—Following the pe-
e riod for public comment under subparagraph

(A), the Secretary shall—

e issue afinalrule regarding an alternative draw schedule described in subparagraph
(A); or

e provide an explanation as to why the rule shall not become final.



(c) STANDARDIZED UNIFORM COMMERCIAL CODE
e« FORMODULAR HOMES.—The Secretary may award a
e grant to study the design and feasibility of a standardized
 uniform commercial code for modular homes, which shall 7 evaluate—

8 (1) the utility of a standardized coding system 9 for serializing and securing modules,
streamlining

10 design and construction, and improving modular 11 home innovation; and
12 (2) a means to coordinate a standardized code 13 with financing incentives.

14 SEC. 303. PROPERTY IMPROVEMENT AND MANUFACTURED 15 HOUSING LOAN
MODERNIZATION ACT.

16 (a) NATIONAL HOUSING ACT AMENDMENTS.— 17 (1) IN GENERAL.—Section 2 of the
National

e Housing Act (12 U.S.C. 1703) is amended—
e (A)insubsection (a), by inserting “con-
e struction of additional or accessory dwelling
units, as defined by the Secretary,” after “energy conserving improvements,”’; and

(B) in subsection (b)— (i) in paragraph (1)—

(I) by striking subparagraph (A) and inserting the following:

“(A) $75,000 if made for the purpose of financ4 ing alterations, repairs and
improvements upon orin

e connection with an existing single-family structure,

e including a manufactured home;”’;

e (Il)in subparagraph (B)— 8 (aa) by striking “$60,000”’ 9 and inserting “$150,000”*;
e (bb) by striking “$12,000”

e andinserting “$37,500”’; and

e (cc) by striking “an apart-



ment house or’”’;

(1) by striking subparagraphs

(C) and (D) and inserting the fol-

lowing:

“(C)(i) $106,405 if made for the purpose of fi-

nancing the purchase of a single-section manufac19 tured home; and

20 “(ii) $195,322 if made for the purpose of financing the purchase of a multi-section

manufactured home;

“(D)(i) $149,782 if made for the purpose of financing the purchase of a single-section
manufactured home and a suitably developed lot on which to place the home; and

“(ii) $238,699 if made for the purpose of fi-

4 nancing the purchase of a multi-section manufac5 tured home and a suitably developed
lot on which to

place the home;”’;

(IV) in subparagraph (E)— 8 (aa) by striking “$23,226” 9 and inserting “$43,377”’; and
(bb) by striking the period

at the end and inserting a semi-

colon;

(V) in subparagraph (F), by

striking “and’’ at the end;

(VI) in subparagraph (G), by

striking the period at the end and in17 serting “; and’’; and

18 (VII) by inserting after subpara19 graph (G) the following:

20

“(H) such principal amount as the Secretary

may prescribe if made for the purpose of financing the construction of an accessory

dwelling unit.”’;

(ii) in the matter immediately preceding paragraph (2)—



e by striking “regulation” and inserting “notice”’;
e by striking “increase’ and
e inserting “set’’;
e (Ill) by striking “(A)(ii), (C),
e (D), and (E)” and inserting “(A)
e through (H)”’;
e (IV)byinserting“ or as nec9 essary to achieve the goals of the Fed-
e eral Housing Administration, periodi-
e callyreset the dollar amount limita12 tions in subparagraphs (A) through
¢ (H) based onjustification and meth-
o odology set forth in advance by regu15 lation” before the period at the end;
e and
¢ (V) by adjusting the margins ap18 propriately;
19 (iii) in paragraph (3), by striking “ex20 ceeds—"" and all that follows through the
21 period at the end and inserting “exceeds
such period of time as determined by the
Secretary, not to exceed 30 years.”;

(iv) by striking paragraph (9) and inserting the following:

“(9) ANNUAL INDEXING OF CERTAIN DOLLAR AMOUNT LIMITATIONS.—The Secretary
shall develop

or choose 1 or more methods of indexing in order to
e annually set the loan limits established in paragraph
e (1), based on data the Secretary determines is ap-
e propriate for purposes of this section.”’; and

e (v)in paragraph (11), by striking



¢ “lease—" and all that follows through the 9 period at the end and inserting “lease
10 meets the terms and conditions established 11 by the Secretary”.
12 (2) DEADLINE FOR DEVELOPMENT OR CHOICE 13 OF NEW INDEX; INTERIM INDEX.—
14 (A) DEADLINE FOR DEVELOPMENT OR

e CHOICE OF NEW INDEX.—Not later than 1 year

o after the date of enactment of this Act, the Sec17 retary of Housing and Urban
Development

e shalldevelop or choose 1 or more methods of
e indexing as required under section 2(b)(9) of
e the National Housing Act (12 S.C.
e 1703(b)(9)), as amended by paragraph (1) of
this subsection.
(B) INTERIM INDEX.—During the period

beginning on the date of enactment of this Act and ending on the date on which the
Secretary of Housing and Urban Development develops or chooses 1 or more methods of
indexing as required under section 2(b)(9) of the National

e Housing Act (12 U.S.C. 1703(b)(9)), as
¢ amended by paragraph (1) of this subsection,

o the method of indexing established by the Sec7 retary under such section 2(b)(9)
before the 8 date of enactment of this Act shall apply.

9 (b) HUD STUDY OF OFF-SITE CONSTRUCTION.— 10 (1) DEFINITIONS.—In this
subsection:

11 (A) OFF-SITE CONSTRUCTION HOUSING.—

12 The term “off-site construction housing” in13 cludes manufactured homes and modular
14 homes.

15 (B) MANUFACTURED HOME.—The term

16 “manufactured home’” means any home con17 structed in accordance with the
construction



18 and safety standards established under the Na19 tional Manufactured Housing
Construction and

o Safety Standards Act of 1974 (42 U.S.C. 5401
e etseq.).
(C) MODULAR HOME.—The term “modular

home” means a home that is constructed in a factory in 1 or more modules, each of which
meets applicable State and local building codes of the area in which the home will be
located, and that are transported to the home building site, installed on foundations, and
completed.

e (2) STUDY.—The Secretary of Housing and

e Urban Development shall conduct a study and sub6 mit to Congress a report on the
cost effectiveness of 7 off-site construction housing, that includes—

¢« (A) an analysis of the advantages and the
e impact of centralization in a factory and trans-
e portation to a construction site on cost, preci11 sion, and materials waste;
12 (B) the extent to which off-site construc13 tion housing meets housing quality standards
e underthe National Standards for the Physical
¢ Inspection of Real Estate, or other standards as

e the Secretary may prescribe, compared to the 17 extent for site-built homes, for
such standards;

¢ (C)the expected replacement and mainte-

¢ nance costs over the first 40 years of life of off-

site construction homes compared to those costs 21 for site-built homes; and

(D) opportunities for use beyond single- family housing, such as applications in accessory
dwelling units, two- to four-unit housing, and large multifamily housing.

SEC. 304. PRICE ACT.

Title | of the Housing and Community Development Act of 1974 (42 U.S.C. 5301 et seq.) is
amended—



e (1)insection 105(a) (42 U.S.C. 5305(a)), in
e the matter preceding paragraph (1), by striking
e “Activities” and inserting “Unless otherwise author-
e ized under section 123, activities’’; and
e (2)byadding at the end the following:
e “SEC. 123. PRESERVATION AND REINVESTMENT FOR COM-
e MUNITY ENHANCEMENT.
e “(a) DEFINITIONS.—In this section:
12 “(1) COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT FINANCIAL IN-

13 STITUTION.—The term ‘community development fi14 nancial institution’ means an
institution that has

e been certified as a community development financial

e institution (as defined in section 103 of the Riegle

¢ Community Development and Regulatory Improve-

¢ mentActof1994 (12 U.S.C. 4702)) by the Sec19 retary of the Treasury.
20 “(2) ELIGIBLE MANUFACTURED HOUSING COM-

21 MUNITY.—The term ‘eligible manufactured housing community’ means a manufactured
housing community that—

“(A) is affordable to low- and moderate-income persons, as determined by the Secretary,

but not more than 120 percent of the area median income; and
“(B)(i) is owned by the residents of the

e manufactured housing community through a

e resident-controlled entity such as a resident-

e owned cooperative; or

e “(ii) will be maintained as such a commu-



e nity, and remain affordable for low- and mod9 erate-income persons, to the
maximum extent

e practicable and for the longest period feasible.
e “(3) ELIGIBLE RECIPIENT.—The term ‘eligible 12 recipient’ means—
e “(A)an eligible manufactured housing
e community;
e “(B) aunit of general local government;
e “(C)ahousing authority;
e “(D)aresident-owned community;
e “(E) aresident-owned cooperative;
e “(F) a nonprofit entity with housing exper-
o tise oraconsortium of such entities;
e “(G) acommunity development financial
institution;
“(H) an Indian tribe;
“(I) a tribally designated housing entity;
“(J) the Department of Hawaiian Home
Lands;
“(K) a State; or
4 “(L) any other entity that is— 5 “(i) an owner-operator of an eligible

6 manufactured housing community; and 7 “(ii) working with an eligible manu8 factured
housing community.

e “(4) INDIAN TRIBE.—The term ‘Indian tribe’

e has the meaning given the term ‘Indian tribe’ in sec11 tion 4 of the Native American
Housing Assistance

¢ and Self-Determination Act of 1996 (25 U.S.C.

. 4103).



e “(5) MANUFACTURED HOUSING COMMUNITY.— 15 The term ‘manufactured
housing community’

e means—
e “(A) any community, court, park, or other

¢ land under unified ownership developed and ac19 commodating, or equipped to
accommodate, the 20 placement of manufactured homes, where— 21 “(i) spaces
within such community are

e orwill be primarily used for residential oc-
e cupancy;
e “(ii) all homes within the community

e are used for permanent occupancy; and “(iii) a majority of such occupied spaces
within the community are occupied by manufactured homes, which may in-

e clude homes constructed prior to enact-
« ment of the Manufactured Home Construc6 tion and Safety Standards; or

7 “(B) any community that meets the defini8 tion of manufactured housing community
used 9 for programs similar to the program under this

10 section.

11 “(6) RESIDENT HEALTH, SAFETY, AND ACCES12 SIBILITY ACTIVITIES.—The term
‘resident health,

13 safety, and accessibility activities’ means the recon14 struction, repair, or replacement
of manufactured

¢ housing and manufactured housing communities
o to—

e “(A) protect the health and safety of resi-

e dents;

e “(B) address weatherization and reduce

e utility costs; or

e “(C)address accessibility needs for resi22 dents with disabilities.



23

“(7) TRIBALLY DESIGNATED HOUSING ENTI-
—The term ‘tribally designated housing entity’

has the meaning given the term in section 4 of the Native American Housing
Assistance and Self-Determination Act of 1996 (25 U.S.C. 4103).

“(b) ESTABLISHMENT.—There is authorized a com4 petitive grant program that the
Secretary shall, by notice,

carry out to make awards utilizing funds appropriated for
such purpose to eligible recipients to carry out eligible
projects for development of or improvements to eligible
manufactured housing communities.
“(c) ELIGIBLE PROJECTS.—
“(1) IN—Amounts from grants
under this section may be used for—
“(A) community infrastructure, facilities,
utilities, and other land improvements in or
serving an eligible manufactured housing com-
munity;
“(B) reconstruction or repair of existing
housing within an eligible manufactured hous-
ing community;
“(C) replacement of homes within an eligi-
ble manufactured housing community;
“(D) planning;
“(E) resident health, safety, and accessi-
bility activities in homes in an eligible manufac-

tured housing community;



“(F) land and site acquisition and infrastructure for expansion or construction of an el-

igible manufactured housing community;

“(G) resident and community services, in-
cluding relocation assistance, eviction preven-
tion, and down payment assistance; and

“(H) any other activity that— 8 “(i) is approved by the Secretary con9 sistent with the
requirements under this

section;

“(ii) improves the overall living condi12 tions of an eligible manufactured housing

13 community, which may include the addi14 tion or enhancement of shared spaces such

as community centers, recreational areas,

or other facilities that support resident 17 well-being and community engagement;
and

“(iii) is necessary to protect the

health and safety of the residents of the el21 igible manufactured housing
community

and the long-term affordability and sus-

tainability of the community.

“(2) REPLACEMENT.—For purposes of subparagraphs (B) and (C) of paragraph (1), grants
under this section—

“(A) may not be used for rehabilitation or
modernization of units that were built before
June 15, 1976; and

“(B) may only be used for disposition and

replacement of units described in subparagraph 9 (A), provided that any
replacement housing

complies with the Manufactured Home Con-



struction and Safety Standards or is another al-

lowed type of home, as determined by the Sec-

“(d) PRIORITY.—In awarding grants under this sec15 tion, the Secretary shall
prioritize applicants that will

16 carry out activities that primarily benefit low- and mod17 erate-income residents and
preserve long-term housing af18 fordability for residents of eligible manufactured housing
19 communities.

“(e) WAIVERS.—The Secretary may waive or specify

alternative requirements for any provision of law or regu22 lation that the Secretary
administers in connection with

use of amounts made available under this section other

than requirements related to fair housing, nondiscrimina25 tion, labor standards,
and the environment, upon a finding that the waiver or alternative requirement is not
inconsistent with the overall purposes of this section and that the waiver or
alternative requirement is necessary to facili4 tate the use of amounts made
available under this section.

“(f) IMPLEMENTATION.—
“(1) IN GENERAL.—Any grant made under this

section shall be made pursuant to criteria for selec8 tion of recipients of such grants
that the Secretary 9 shall by regulation establish and publish together

10 with any notification of availability of amounts 11 under this section.

12

“(2) SET-ASIDE OF GRANT AMOUNTS.—The
Secretary may set aside amounts provided under
this section for grants to Indian tribes, tribally des-
ignated housing entities, and the Department of Ha-

waiian Home Lands.”.

Part lll. Places in bill that use the term "preempt."

From Title Il.



"RULES OF CONSTRUCTION.—Nothing in this section shall be construed to authorize the
Secretary to mandate, supersede, or preempt any local zoning or land use policy; or"

These two from from Title Ill.

PREEMPTION.—Nothing in this section or the amendments made by this section shall be
construed as limiting the scope of Federal preemption under section 604(d) of the National
Manufactured Housing Construction and Safety Standards Act of 1974 (42 U.S.C. 5403(d)).

These uses of preempt from Title IV.

“(A) in accordance with the terms of the preemptive purchase option, lease, covenant on
the land, or other similar legal instrument of the community land trust when the terms and
rights in the preemptive purchase option, lease, covenant, or legal instrument are and
remain subject to the requirements of this title; ..."

From Title V.

“(E) maintains preemptive purchase options to purchase the property if such purchase
would allow the housing to remain affordable to low-and moderate-income persons.”

Part lll. Additional Facts-Evidence-Analysis (FEA) from sources as shown including
more MHProNews expert commentary.

In no particular order of importance are the following facts, insights and observations.

1)


https://www.manufacturedhomepronews.com/wp-content/uploads/2025/08/MHVilleFEA-DefinedFacts-Evidence-AnalysisDianaDutsykHighestFormOfJournalismIsAnalyticalJournalismGriffinsNestHowardWalkerTonyKovachsPublicationsAmericanPressInstituteAPI-MHProNews.jpg
https://www.manufacturedhomepronews.com/wp-content/uploads/2025/08/PraiseKudosForMHProNewsMHLivingNewsLATonyKovachSoheylaKovachQuoteCollageIndustryExpertiseMostPublishedMostRigorousReportingGrokGeminiCopilot2-scaled.png

