
 

Draft for AI pre-publication fact check of developing article on MHProNews on the topics as 
shown. 

Washington State-Affordable Housing Case Study. Billions Spent on Homeless but 
Homelessness Rises. ‘Need More Affordable Homes’ Lack of Affordable Manufactured 
Homes isn’t Victimless Crime-FEA 

"Washington’s total population has only grown by 9% since 2016, meaning homelessness 
is outpacing population growth despite an unprecedented amount of spending designed to 
prevent that trend," states the recent report from RealClearInvestigations (RCI) provided in 
Part I. According to left-leaning Cascade PBS: “We don’t need more luxury apartments 
built...What we need is affordable housing.” That is found in Part II of this MHVille facts-
evidence-analysis (FEA) format mashup. After saying: "only about one affordable home for 
every five households that need one is available in Washington," ironically, Cascade PBS 
glossed over what ought to be a key point (emphasis in part of what follows is added). "The 
state has also set aside money in recent years to purchase emergency housing and 
temporary shelters, distribute loans for rural housing rehabilitation, and preserve mobile 
homes." A MS WORD check of both articles has zero results for manufactured homes, 
manufactured housing, modular, prefab, factory-built, or 'off-site' housing. Meaning, none 
of the more common terms that are used to describe modern factory-crafted HUD Code 
manufactured or modular housing are mentioned. RCI's use of Cascade PBS' and state-
data produced research is focused on the fact that the spending didn't produce the desired 
results. Has the Manufactured Housing Institute (MHI) or an MHI affiliated state association 
used this data to show the need for producing more HUD Code manufactured homes? That 
and more will be explored in Part III. Part III will also ask third-party artificial intelligence (AI) 
this question. If one or more market-manipulating crime(s) are in evidence in 
manufactured housing that are causing historic underperformance in the 21st century, is 
the crime victimless? Or are potentially millions of Americans being harmed day by day? 

Years before the FEA format was formally defined, an operating premise of MHLivingNews 
and MHProNews was to provide factually accurate information and evidence that spanned 
the left-right media and political divides. Those remarks have been cross-checked and 
verified by multiple third-party AI systems.  The infographic above Part I was offered by left-
leaning Bing's AI powered Copilot to MHProNews following a Q&A session. In Part III, the 
statements in this preface will be put to the test using AI. See the AI 'verdict' in Part III of 
this article.  That is said to make this next point. Years before this RCI-Cascade PBS-
Washington State research and reporting, MHLivingNews published the following. Using 
local media and other reporting, MHLivingNews systematically made the case that without 
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more manufactured housing, homelessness would only spread. Housing had to include 
significantly more "inherently affordable manufactured homes" as the Manufactured 
Housing Association for Regulatory Reform (MHARR) has said. 

  

[caption id="attachment_137233" align="aligncenter" width="600"]

 
https://www.manufacturedhomelivingnews.com/why-is-seattle-dying-affordable-housing-
misplaced-compassion-and-manufactured-homes/ [/caption] 

  

MHProNews ran a similar report. 
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[caption id="attachment_136415" align="aligncenter" width="600"]

 
https://www.manufacturedhomelivingnews.com/why-is-seattle-dying-affordable-housing-
misplaced-compassion-and-manufactured-homes/ [/caption] 

  

MHLivingNews has previously reported on the point that the population is growing yet the 
numbers of new affordable housing units have failed to keep pace. 
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https://www.manufacturedhomelivingnews.com/is-manufactured-home-production-
keeping-pace-with-u-s-population-what-california-adu-preemption-and-higher-
production-signals-manufactured-housing-potential-to-solve-affordable-housing-
crisis/[/caption] 

  

Did MHI ever run similar reports based on the viral Seattle is Dying reporting and its 
arguably nexus with the lack of enough manufactured homes? See in Part III. 
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This MHVille FEA is underway. 

Part I. From RealClearInvestigations via RealClearWire to MHProNews via reprint 
permissions 

Waste of the Day: Washington Pays For Homeless Crisis 

By Jeremy Portnoy, RealClearInvestigations 
September 22, 2025 

Topline: The State of Washington spent $5 billion on homelessness prevention programs 
over the last 12 years, but there has been little measurable impact so far. There are 
currently more homeless people in Washington than at any point since at least 2016. 

Key facts: From 2013 to 2021, Washington spent an average of $131 million per year on 
homelessness prevention and affordable housing, according to Cascade PBS. Since 2022, 
the state has spent an average of $1.05 billion per year on the same programs. 

Yet according to the state’s biannual Snapshot of Homelessness reports, there are 
currently more people in need of housing than ever. Washington had 126,091 homeless 
people in January 2016, but 158,791 people in January 2025 — a 26% increase. 

Washington’s total population has only grown by 9% since 2016, meaning homelessness is 
outpacing population growth despite an unprecedented amount of spending designed to 
prevent that trend. 

Washington will spend $1.8 billion on homeless services and housing in 2026 and 2027, or 
$900 million per year. The money comes from taxes and from the $303.50 Recording Fee, a 
charge for filing documents with the county auditor that is used to provide down payment 
and closing cost assistance to reduce racial disparities in homeownership. 

Fee revenue is expected to decrease because of declining real estate transactions, 
meaning a higher percentage of homeless spending will now come from taxes. 

Background: The Washington Department of Commerce, which coordinates the state’s 
homeless response, spent $64 million on payroll last year. There were 142 employees who 
earned at least $100,000. Director Michael Fong made $217,400, making him the first 
person at the agency to ever earn more than $200,000 in one year. 

Search all federal, state and local salaries and vendor spending with the world’s largest 
government spending database at OpenTheBooks.com.  

https://www.realclearinvestigations.com/articles/2025/09/22/waste_of_the_day_washington_pays_for_homeless_crisis_1135494.html
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Summary: Washington’s vulnerable communities deserve actionable solutions that 
achieve tangible results, not an endless stream of funding increases. 

The #WasteOfTheDay is brought to you by the forensic auditors at OpenTheBooks.com 

--- 

Part II. From Cascade PBS Under Republish and Fair Use Guidelines for Media 

WA spent $5B over past decade on homelessness, housing programs 

The money has helped accelerate housing construction in the state, but there’s still only 
one affordable home for every five households that need one. 

For much of the past decade, the amount of money Washington lawmakers dedicated to 
housing and homelessness programs grew gradually, climbing from around $200 million to 
$400 million in each two-year budget between 2013 and 2021. 

But in the past four years this spending has surged, according to an analysis of state 
spending data provided by the Office of Financial Management. 

These figures show that more than $4 billion – or around 80% – of the roughly $5 billion 
directed to expanding housing and preventing homelessness since 2013 has been packed 
into the past two state budgets. 

That spike is due to an infusion of federal pandemic aid. But it also reflects a growing 
acknowledgment among lawmakers that Washington has a housing problem, particularly a 
shortage of affordable homes. 

The additional spending has gone toward improving homeless services, purchasing 
temporary shelters, building more affordable housing and providing rent assistance. 

While it’s helped, affordable-housing construction is still not meeting the estimated need; 
rents remain too high for many tenants; and home ownership is often out of reach for lower 
and even middle-income households. 

The numbers 

According to data from the Office of Financial Management, Washington has poured about 
$3.4 billion into homelessness prevention programs and another $1.9 billion into housing 
construction since 2013, a total of around $5.3 billion. 

Between 2013 and 2021, spending on housing and homelessness programs averaged 
about $262 million under each two-year budget. In the past two budgets combined, it 
totaled upward of $4.2 billion, including more than $1 billion in federal COVID aid. 
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The state’s entire operating budget for the current two-year budget cycle is around $72 
billion. 

Outside of federal funding, one of the main ways the state funds housing and 
homelessness services is through a document recording fee, which people pay at their 
county auditor’s office when retrieving certain legal documents. 

Funding from that fee is split among a range of programs, including counties’ homeless 
housing plans, rent assistance, incentives for landlords who house people with rent 
assistance, and building and maintenance of permanent supportive housing. 

During the budget cycle that ends next June, more than $562 million is dedicated to 
programs funded by these fees – up from more than $251 million during the previous cycle. 
Before 2021, less than $100 million was set aside for these programs every two years. 

Another pot of money is the state’s housing and essential needs support program, which 
provides low-income people with essential-needs items, like hygiene products or transit 
cards, or rental assistance if they cannot work due to their physical or mental condition. 
That fund saw a boost in the past four years as well. In this two-year budget cycle, 
lawmakers set aside $130 million, up from $114 million the cycle before and $78 million in 
the 2019-2021 cycle. 

Since 2021, Washington state has spent about $1.5 billion on housing construction, 
compared to about $446 million between 2013 and 2021. 

Most of the money spent on construction in the past decade has been through the Housing 
Trust Fund, which gives grants to affordable-housing providers. 

From 2013 until 2019, the trust fund was the only account lawmakers used to fund 
affordable housing. Back in 2013, lawmakers dropped $56 million into it. During the past 
two years, they’ve devoted a record $500 million to the fund. 

The state has also set aside money in recent years to purchase emergency housing and 
temporary shelters, distribute loans for rural housing rehabilitation, and preserve mobile 
homes. 

Has it helped? 

The money for housing construction has helped, according to the Department of 
Commerce. 

On average, around 24,100 units were built in Washington every year between 2011 and 
2015. In the next four-year period, the state averaged almost 41,000 units every year. 

https://washingtonstatestandard.com/2024/03/29/inslee-oks-2-billion-boost-in-state-spending/?ref=cascadepbs.org
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Between 2020 and 2023, about 46,400 units were built annually – slightly above the 
projected annual need of 46,118. 

Despite more home construction overall, Tedd Kelleher, housing policy manager at the 
Department of Commerce, said in a statement that investments in affordable housing have 
not kept pace with Washington’s population growth. 

According to Commerce, only about one affordable home for every five households that 
need one is available in Washington. The state needs to build about 27,011 low-income 
units every year to keep up with demand, the department’s estimates show. Between 2020 
and 2023, the statewide average for the number of units built for low-income families was 
23,877. 

Michele Thomas, director of policy and advocacy at the Washington Low Income Housing 
Alliance, said the state needs to put more emphasis on affordable-housing construction, 
not necessarily all types of new housing construction. 

“We don’t need more luxury apartments built,” she said. “What we need is affordable 
housing.” 

When it comes to funding for homelessness support and services, Thomas said the money 
has helped those experiencing homelessness, but the state needs to do more to address 
the root causes of homelessness, like steep rent increases and the lack of affordable 
housing. 

Every time a state program helps someone avoid homelessness, she said, more people fall 
into it, creating a “constant churn.” 

“Every one of those dollars has changed somebody’s life,” Thomas said. “But there’s 
nothing to stop more people from experiencing homelessness.” 

This story was originally published by the Washington State Standard on May 20, 
2024. Washington State Standard is part of States Newsroom, a nonprofit news network 
supported by grants and a coalition of donors as a 501c(3) public charity. Washington State 
Standard maintains editorial independence. Follow Washington State Standard 
on Facebook and Twitter. 

By Laurel Demkovich | May 26, 2024 | Republish 

Laurel Demkovich is the state politics reporter for Cascade PBS. Previously, she covered 
state government in Olympia for the Washington State Standard and the Spokesman-
Review. 

--- 
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Part III. Additional Facts-Evidence-Analysis from sources as shown plus more MHProNews 
expert MHVille commentary. 

1) Stating the obvious can bring clarity. The topic is the lack of affordable housing and how 
that lack of affordable housing is an apparent contributing factor to more 
homelessness.  The following articles have dealt with that topic, either recent (near the top) 
or from prior years (further below). 

  

[caption id="attachment_221533" align="aligncenter" width="600"]

 
https://www.manufacturedhomelivingnews.com/in-battle-for-more-affordable-housing-ai-
systems-chatgpt-copilot-xais-grok-and-gemini-are-asked-to-check-facts-evidence-
analysis-fea-do-manufactured-homes-fit-in-chatgpt-case-study [/caption] 
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[caption id="attachment_221123" align="aligncenter" width="600"]

 
https://www.manufacturedhomelivingnews.com/unpacking-national-low-income-housing-
coalition-release-of-gap-2025-shortage-of-7-1-million-affordable-homes-gap-report-hits-
and-misses-revealed-in-mhville-facts-evidence-analysis-f/ [/caption] 

  

[caption id="attachment_219911" align="aligncenter" width="600"]

 
https://www.manufacturedhomepronews.com/hawaii-state-tax-policy-housing-gemini-
media-misses-homelessness-housing-manufactured-homes-gemini-confirms-concern-
about-cia-in-q-tel-and-psyops-sunday-weekly-mhville-fea-headlines-recap/[/caption] 
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https://www.manufacturedhomepronews.com/hud-documents-own-failures-to-congress-
homelessness-soars-to-record-high-under-biden-harris-im-mad-as-hell-what-hud-did-
and-didnt-say-in-annual-homelessn/ [/caption] 
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https://www.manufacturedhomepronews.com/leftist-michael-weinstein-tens-of-billions-
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to-affordable-housing-industrial-complex-wasted-on-housing-trickle-down-democrats-
have-failed-americans-in-need-facts-w-analysis-plus-mhmarkets/[/caption] 

  

[caption id="attachment_193209" align="aligncenter" width="600"]

 
https://www.manufacturedhomepronews.com/opb-probes-homelessness-causes-
possible-fixes-most-agree-blame-falls-on-lack-of-affordable-housing-pallets-
manufactured-home-takeaways-ai-insights-analysis-plus-mhville-markets/[/caption] 

  

2) While MHI has postured and used optics-focused efforts to promote themselves, 
MHARR made a systematic effort to meet with key federal officials at HUD and FHFA until 
they finally reached out early this month to President Donald J. Trump, other administration 
officials, plus leaders of both the Democratic and Republic parties. 
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https://manufacturedhousingassociationregulatoryreform.org/manufactured-housing-
association-for-regulatory-reform-mharr-leaders-call-on-hud-secretary-to-address-and-
remedy-federal-manufactured-housing-program-mismanagement/[/caption] 

  

[caption id="attachment_221355" align="aligncenter" width="566"]

 
https://manufacturedhousingassociationregulatoryreform.org/mharr-communication-to-

https://manufacturedhousingassociationregulatoryreform.org/manufactured-housing-association-for-regulatory-reform-mharr-leaders-call-on-hud-secretary-to-address-and-remedy-federal-manufactured-housing-program-mismanagement/
https://manufacturedhousingassociationregulatoryreform.org/manufactured-housing-association-for-regulatory-reform-mharr-leaders-call-on-hud-secretary-to-address-and-remedy-federal-manufactured-housing-program-mismanagement/
https://manufacturedhousingassociationregulatoryreform.org/manufactured-housing-association-for-regulatory-reform-mharr-leaders-call-on-hud-secretary-to-address-and-remedy-federal-manufactured-housing-program-mismanagement/
https://manufacturedhousingassociationregulatoryreform.org/mharr-communication-to-president-trump-seeks-elimination-of-industry-bottlenecks-as-part-of-cure-for-affordable-housing-crisis/
https://manufacturedhousingassociationregulatoryreform.org/manufactured-housing-association-for-regulatory-reform-mharr-leaders-call-on-hud-secretary-to-address-and-remedy-federal-manufactured-housing-program-mismanagement/
https://manufacturedhousingassociationregulatoryreform.org/mharr-communication-to-president-trump-seeks-elimination-of-industry-bottlenecks-as-part-of-cure-for-affordable-housing-crisis/


president-trump-seeks-elimination-of-industry-bottlenecks-as-part-of-cure-for-affordable-
housing-crisis/[/caption] 

  

3) Meanwhile, MHProNews has used third-party AI systems to document that MHI leaders 
have been posturing efforts without taking meaningful action or logical steps to boost the 
demand for HUD code manufactured homes. To demonstrate how MHI has operated for 
years, prior to the Innovative Housing Showcase (IHS) 2025 - which included a display of 
multiple manufactured homes on the National Mall in Washington, D.C. - MHProNews 
reached out to MHI's top board and senior staff leadership with an "acid test." 
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The post-event fact-evidence-analysis (FEA) by left-leaning Google's AI powered Gemini 
and other AI systems documented that MHI's leaders failed to make the suggested and 
logical efforts. 
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